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This document is universal instruction which can be used 
to create the cleaning program for the installed floorings. 
Cleaning program should be created by co-operation 
with cleaning experts paying attention to use and 
conditions. 

 
It is recommended to use polyester pads under furniture 

legs to get flooring lasting in longer. 

 
INITIAL CLEANING 
 

Remove loose dirt by mopping or vacuuming. 

Machine wash the floor with a combination or floor care 
machine. Use a red pads or medium-hard brushes, a 
weakly alkaline detergent, or an alkaline detergent 
solution for a more soiled floor. Avoid excessive use of 
water and make sure that the floor surface remains dry. 

It is recommended to treat a clean and dry floor with a 
cleaning and care solution for ESD floor care (eg TASKI 
Jontec Destat). 

 

 

POLISHES 

The Kährs Upofloor Estrad Ultimate SD floor should not 
be waxed in the health care area. In another area when 
waxing is allowed you can use the applicable ESD wax. 

 

ROUTINE MAINTENANCE  
 

Use the machine whenever possible. The floor then stays 
cleaner. Remove dust and loose debris from the floor. For 
cleaning with scrubber drier  or manual methods, use an 
ESD floor cleaning and care solution (eg TASKI Jontec 
Destat). For basic treatment, wet wipe the floor and allow 
the cleaning and care solution to dry on the floor. Treat the 
floor regularly. 

 

BASIC CLEANING 

 

Wash heavily soiled floors with an alkaline, if necessary 
strongly alkaline cleaning solution. Use a floor care 
machine or scrubber drier with red pads. Rinse thoroughly. 
Treat the floor with an ESD floor care agent (Destat). 

After basic cleaning of the waxed floor, you can polish 

floor once with ESD wax. 
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